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The sacred Flower of Life pattern, the primary geometric generator of all physical form, is explored in even
more depth in this volume, the second half of the famed Flower of Life workshop. The proportions of the
human body, the nuances of human consciousness, the sizes and distances of the stars, planets and moons,
even the creations of humankind, are all shown to reflect their origins in this beautiful and divine image.
Through an intricate and detailed geometrical mapping, Drunvalo Melchizedek shows how the seemingly
simple design of the Flower of Life contains the genesis of our entire third-dimensional existence.

From the pyramids and mysteries of Egypt to the new race of Indigo children, Drunvalo presents the sacred
geometries of the Reality and the subtle energies that shape our world. We are led through a divinely inspired
labyrinth of science and stories, logic and coincidence, on a path of remembering where we come from and
the wonder and magic of who we are.

Finally, for the first time in print, Drunvalo shares the instructions for the Mer-Ka-Ba meditation, step-by-
step techniques for the re-creation of the energy field of the evolved human, which is the key to ascension
and the next dimensional world. If done from love, this ancient process of breathing prana opens up for us a
world of tantalizing possibility in this dimension, from protective powers to the healing of oneself, of others
and even of the planet. You may discover a memory or a fleeting reflection of yourself in the following
topics:

The Unfolding of the Third Informational System The Circles and Squares of Human Consciousness,●

Leonardo da Vinci's True Understanding of the Flower of Life, Exploring the Rooms of the Great Pyramid
Whispers from Our Ancient Heritage The Initiations of Egypt, the Mysteries of Resurrection,●

Interdimensional Conception, Ancient Mystery Schools, Egyptian Tantra, Sexual Energy and the Orgasm
Unveiling the Mer-Ka-Ba Meditation Chakras and the Human Energy System, Energy Fields around the●

Body, the Seventeen Breaths of the Mer-Ka-Ba Meditation, the Sacred Geometry of the Human Lightbody
Using Your Mer-Ka-Ba The Siddhis or Psychic Powers, Programming Your Mer-Ka-Ba, Healing from●

the Prana Sphere, Coincidence, Thought and Manifestation, Creaing a Surrogate Mer-Ka-Ba
Connecting to the Levels of Self Mother Earth and Your Inner Child, Life with Your Higher Self, How to●

Communicate with Everything, the Lessons of the Seven Angels
Two Cosmic Experiments The Lucifer Experiment and the Creation of Duality, the 1972 Sirian●

Experiment and the Rebuilding of the Christ Consciousness Grid
What We May Expect in the Forthcoming Dimensional Shift How to Prepare, Survival in the Fourth●

Dimension, the New Children

Embrace the expanded vision and understanding that Drunvalo offers to the world. Coincidences abound,
miracles flourish and amazing stories of mysteries unveiled arise as the author probes the Ancient Secrets of
the Flower of Life.
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From reader reviews:

Carlos White:

Book is definitely written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can know everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important thing to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A book The Ancient Secret of the Flower of
Life, Volume 2 will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know
about every little thing. But some of you think which open or reading a new book make you bored. It's not
make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you seeking best book or acceptable book with
you?

Timothy Holeman:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic in the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different
to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your free time/
holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to test look
for book, may be the reserve untitled The Ancient Secret of the Flower of Life, Volume 2 can be great book
to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

John Dinwiddie:

This The Ancient Secret of the Flower of Life, Volume 2 is great reserve for you because the content that is
certainly full of information for you who all always deal with world and still have to make decision every
minute. This particular book reveal it details accurately using great manage word or we can declare no
rambling sentences within it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it
only gives you straight forward sentences but challenging core information with splendid delivering
sentences. Having The Ancient Secret of the Flower of Life, Volume 2 in your hand like getting the world in
your arm, details in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no guide that offer you world inside ten or
fifteen minute right but this guide already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs.
occupied do you still doubt which?

John Yates:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many question for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes looking at, not only science book but in addition novel and The Ancient Secret of the Flower of
Life, Volume 2 or even others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the truly
amazing a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or perhaps
students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to increase their knowledge. In different case, beside



science publication, any other book likes The Ancient Secret of the Flower of Life, Volume 2 to make your
spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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