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In this book, novelist Colm Tóibín offers a deeply personal introduction to the work and life of one of his
most important literary influences--the American poet Elizabeth Bishop. Ranging across her poetry, prose,
letters, and biography, Tóibín creates a vivid picture of Bishop while also revealing how her work has helped
shape his sensibility as a novelist and how her experiences of loss and exile resonate with his own. What
emerges is a compelling double portrait that will intrigue readers interested in both Bishop and Tóibín.

For Tóibín, the secret of Bishop's emotional power is in what she leaves unsaid. Exploring Bishop's famous
attention to detail, Tóibín describes how Bishop is able to convey great emotion indirectly, through precise
descriptions of particular settings, objects, and events. He examines how Bishop's attachment to the Nova
Scotia of her childhood, despite her later life in Key West and Brazil, is related to her early loss of her
parents--and how this connection finds echoes in Tóibín's life as an Irish writer who has lived in Barcelona,
New York, and elsewhere.

Beautifully written and skillfully blending biography, literary appreciation, and descriptions of Tóibín's
travels to Bishop's Nova Scotia, Key West, and Brazil, On Elizabeth Bishop provides a fresh and memorable
look at a beloved poet even as it gives us a window into the mind of one of today's most acclaimed novelists.
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From reader reviews:

Willie Dreher:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also work as a life style. This
reading habit give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual
information inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get
based on what kind of e-book you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with training books but if
you want truly feel happy read one having theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual On
Elizabeth Bishop (Writers on Writers) is kind of publication which is giving the reader capricious
experience.

Dolores Schreiber:

This On Elizabeth Bishop (Writers on Writers) is great e-book for you because the content which is full of
information for you who have always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This specific
book reveal it data accurately using great plan word or we can state no rambling sentences inside it. So if you
are read it hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward
sentences but difficult core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having On Elizabeth Bishop
(Writers on Writers) in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous 1. We can
say that no reserve that offer you world inside ten or fifteen small right but this reserve already do that. So ,
this really is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt that?

Carey Gilliam:

The book untitled On Elizabeth Bishop (Writers on Writers) contain a lot of information on this. The writer
explains your girlfriend idea with easy method. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so
do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read that. The book was compiled by famous author. The author
gives you in the new age of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can read more your
smart phone, or program, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the
e-book, you can wide open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice go through.

Ruth Vazquez:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our know-how for everything. By a publication we can know
everything you want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year had been
exactly added. This publication On Elizabeth Bishop (Writers on Writers) was filled regarding science.
Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has
different feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can sense
enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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