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INTRODUCTION.

The object of the author in preparing this work was twofold: First, to rescue from oblivion certain important
historical facts, fast fading from the memory of men, connected with the struggle in East Tennessee from
1861 to 1865; secondly, to vindicate the course of the Union people of East Tennessee in separating from
their friends and kindred in the South, and in adhering to the National Government. Their constancy and
fortitude, their trials and sufferings for what they deemed right, have no parallel in the history of this country.
To present these in connected and permanent form it is believed will add a new and missing chapter to the
history of the great drama known as the Civil War.
The aim and desire of the author have been to discuss and present the facts of the struggle in East Tennessee
with candor and truthfulness, and yet without offensiveness. The author was Southern by birth, education
and residence, and bound to the South by the ties of interest, association and many long friendships. On the
other hand, he was drawn toward the North by a strong love of the Union, and an ardent desire for its
preservation. He was a slaveholder, and in sympathy with the peculiar institutions of the South. Besides, time
has softened his feelings, and to a certain extent modified his views regarding some of the questions formerly
dividing the two sections. These facts, as he conceives, fit him for setting forth dispassionately not only the
apparent, but the inner motives that influenced the Southern people in their movement for independence in
1861. In addition, the circumstance that he was an eye-witness of many of the occurrences he describes, and
an active participant in them, gives him peculiar qualifications for this work.
The author wishes to return his grateful acknowledgments to Prof. Edward S. Joynes, LL.D,, of South
Carolina College, and to R. R. Sutherland, D.D., of Knoxville, Tennessee, for assistance and suggestions
kindly given in the preparation of this work. He also extends his thanks to General Marcus J. Wright, of the
War Records Office, Washington, D. C, for important documents. He especially expresses his most earnest
appreciation of the kindness of Colonel John B. Brownlow in furnishing him with much valuable
information, for many suggestions and numerous documents, and for the use of files of the Knoxville Whig,
edited by his distinguished father.
THE AUTHOR.
Knoxville, Tenn., September 9, 1899.
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From reader reviews:

Verla Foster:

Reading a book tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on earth always try to improve
their skill in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write to the book. One of them is this
East Tennessee and the Civil War.

Anne Shivers:

Often the book East Tennessee and the Civil War has a lot of information on it. So when you read this book
you can get a lot of advantage. The book was written by the very famous author. This articles author makes
some research ahead of write this book. That book very easy to read you can get the point easily after reading
this book.

Marvin Ober:

Reading a book being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to examine a book. When you
examine a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, due to
the fact book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can read education books, but
if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The
East Tennessee and the Civil War will give you new experience in examining a book.

Julie Gibson:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. That book East Tennessee and the Civil War was colourful and of
course has pictures around. As we know that book East Tennessee and the Civil War has many kinds or
variety. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and
believe that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers
you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading
which.
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