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While still a teenager, Patrick Leigh Fermor made his way across Europe, as recounted in his classic
memoirs, A Time of Gifts and Between the Woods and the Water. During World War II, he fought with local
partisans against the Nazi occupiers of Crete. But in A Time to Keep Silence, Leigh Fermor writes about a
more inward journey, describing his several sojourns in some of Europe’s oldest and most venerable
monasteries. He stays at the Abbey of St. Wandrille, a great repository of art and learning; at Solesmes,
famous for its revival of Gregorian chant; and at the deeply ascetic Trappist monastery of La Grande Trappe,
where monks take a vow of silence. Finally, he visits the rock monasteries of Cappadocia, hewn from the
stony spires of a moonlike landscape, where he seeks some trace of the life of the earliest Christian
anchorites.

More than a history or travel journal, however, this beautiful short book is a meditation on the meaning of
silence and solitude for modern life. Leigh Fermor writes, “In the seclusion of a cell—an existence whose
quietness is only varied by the silent meals, the solemnity of ritual, and long solitary walks in the
woods—the troubled waters of the mind grow still and clear, and much that is hidden away and all that
clouds it floats to the surface and can be skimmed away; and after a time one reaches a state of peace that is
unthought of in the ordinary world.”
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From reader reviews:

Cindy Grant:

Throughout other case, little people like to read book A Time to Keep Silence (New York Review Books
Classics). You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Given that we know about how is
important a book A Time to Keep Silence (New York Review Books Classics). You can add information and
of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can
learn everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple thing until
wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can open a book as well as searching by internet system.
It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's read.

Cristen Washington:

This A Time to Keep Silence (New York Review Books Classics) book is simply not ordinary book, you
have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book will be information
inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper a person read a lot of
information you will get. That A Time to Keep Silence (New York Review Books Classics) without we
know teach the one who examining it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't become worry A
Time to Keep Silence (New York Review Books Classics) can bring whenever you are and not make your
carrier space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This A
Time to Keep Silence (New York Review Books Classics) having great arrangement in word along with
layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Donna Hoffmann:

A Time to Keep Silence (New York Review Books Classics) can be one of your beginning books that are
good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that will
increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the
information. The article writer giving his/her effort to get every word into delight arrangement in writing A
Time to Keep Silence (New York Review Books Classics) but doesn't forget the main level, giving the
reader the hottest and also based confirm resource info that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great
information could drawn you into brand new stage of crucial thinking.

Shari Villa:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This kind of book A Time to Keep Silence (New York Review
Books Classics) was vibrant and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book A Time to
Keep Silence (New York Review Books Classics) has many kinds or style. Start from kids until youngsters.
For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there.
Therefore not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try
to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading this.
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