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AC/DC tells the little-known story of how Thomas Edison wrongly bet in the fierce war between supporters
of alternating current and direct current. The savagery of this electrical battle can hardly be imagined today.
The showdown between AC and DC began as a rather straightforward conflict between technical standards,
a battle of competing methods to deliver essentially the same product, electricity. But the skirmish soon
metastasized into something bigger and darker. In the AC/DC battle, the worst aspects of human nature
somehow got caught up in the wires; a silent, deadly flow of arrogance, vanity, and cruelty. Following the
path of least resistance, the war of currents soon settled around that most primal of human emotions: fear.
AC/DC serves as an object lesson in bad business strategy and poor decision making. Edison's inability to see
his mistake was a key factor in his loss of control over the ?operating system? for his future inventions?not to
mention the company he founded, General Electric.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Battle:

Book is usually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A publication AC/DC: The Savage Tale of the
First Standards War will make you to always be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know
about anything. But some of you think in which open or reading a book make you bored. It is not necessarily
make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or suited book with
you?

Alexandra Dickey:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has different personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't desire do that. You must know how great and also important the book AC/DC: The Savage Tale of
the First Standards War. All type of book can you see on many resources. You can look for the internet
methods or other social media.

Todd Apperson:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or even
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different you can
read a book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the entire day to
reading a publication. The book AC/DC: The Savage Tale of the First Standards War it is quite good to read.
There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. In the
event you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore
quickly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book features high quality.

Kevin Dobson:

Is it a person who having spare time after that spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This AC/DC: The Savage Tale of the First Standards
War can be the reply, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date, spending your free time
by reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the
others?
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