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Now viewed as its own scientific discipline, clinical trial methodology encompasses the methods required for
the protection of participants in a clinical trial and the methods necessary to provide a valid inference about
the objective of the trial. Drawing from the authors’ courses on the subject as well as the first author’s more
than 30 years working in the pharmaceutical industry, Clinical Trial Methodology emphasizes the
importance of statistical thinking in clinical research and presents the methodology as a key component of
clinical research.

From ethical issues and sample size considerations to adaptive design procedures and statistical analysis, the
book first covers the methodology that spans every clinical trial regardless of the area of application. Crucial
to the generic drug industry, bioequivalence clinical trials are then discussed. The authors describe a parallel
bioequivalence clinical trial of six formulations incorporating group sequential procedures that permit
sample size re-estimation. The final chapters incorporate real-world case studies of clinical trials from the
authors’ own experiences. These examples include a landmark Phase III clinical trial involving the treatment
of duodenal ulcers and Phase III clinical trials that contributed to the first drug approved for the treatment of
Alzheimer’s disease.

Aided by the U.S. FDA, the U.S. National Institutes of Health, the pharmaceutical industry, and academia,
the area of clinical trial methodology has evolved over the last six decades into a scientific discipline. This
guide explores the processes essential for developing and conducting a quality clinical trial protocol and
providing quality data collection, biostatistical analyses, and a clinical study report, all while maintaining the
highest standards of ethics and excellence.
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From reader reviews:

Todd Jacobs:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they are still students or the item for all people
in the world, the particular best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that issue above. Every
person has different personality and hobby per other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great and also important the book Clinical Trial Methodology
(Chapman & Hall/CRC Biostatistics Series). All type of book is it possible to see on many sources. You can
look for the internet resources or other social media.

Cora Morrell:

As people who live in the modest era should be change about what going on or information even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era which is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to you actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This Clinical Trial Methodology
(Chapman & Hall/CRC Biostatistics Series) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world.
Why, since this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Charlie Smith:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a book you will get new information mainly because book is one of several
ways to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, looking at a book will make a person more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring that you imagine the
story how the people do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read
this Clinical Trial Methodology (Chapman & Hall/CRC Biostatistics Series), you may tells your family,
friends along with soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a
guide.

Mitchell Wilder:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Try and pick one book that you never know the inside because don't ascertain book by its deal with may
doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not since fantastic as
in the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer may be Clinical Trial Methodology (Chapman & Hall/CRC
Biostatistics Series) why because the wonderful cover that make you consider with regards to the content
will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or cover. Your
reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.
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