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Like the acclaimed Apologetics Study Bible that has sold 115,000+ copies, the Apologetics Study Bible for
Students will anchor younger Christians in the truths of Scripture by equipping them with thoughtful and
practical responses for whenever the core issues of their faith and life are challenged.

Multiple research studies have shown that spiritual focus often weakens among teenagers as they head into
the attention-dividing realm of young adulthood. Up to 66% of them leave church altogether. The
Apologetics Study Bible for Students works against that trend by helping this audience begin to better
articulate its beliefs. In addition to the complete HCSB text and dozens of articles collected from today’s
most popular youth leaders, including general editor Sean McDowell, this new study Bible also includes:

• Two-color design-intensive layout on every page for the visual generation

• Sixty “Twisted Scriptures” explanations

• Fifty “Bones & Dirt” entries (archaeology meets apologetics)

• Fifty “Notable Quotes”

• Twenty-five “Tactics” against common anti-Christian arguments

• Twenty “Personal Stories” of how God has worked in real lives

• Twenty “Top Five” lists to help remember key apologetics topics
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From reader reviews:

Bernice Hicks:

What do you consider book? It is just for students as they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
different personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't want do
that. You must know how great and also important the book Apologetics Study Bible for Students,
Black/Tan LeatherTouch. All type of book are you able to see on many options. You can look for the internet
solutions or other social media.

Mildred Brummett:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or information even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems
coming to a person is you don't know what type you should start with. This Apologetics Study Bible for
Students, Black/Tan LeatherTouch is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because
book serves what you want and need in this era.

Kaci Carter:

The book untitled Apologetics Study Bible for Students, Black/Tan LeatherTouch contain a lot of
information on that. The writer explains the woman idea with easy method. The language is very clear and
understandable all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by
famous author. The author gives you in the new era of literary works. You can actually read this book
because you can keep reading your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book throughout anywhere
and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official web-site along with order it. Have
a nice learn.

Curtis Swasey:

Beside this Apologetics Study Bible for Students, Black/Tan LeatherTouch in your phone, it could possibly
give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you will got
here is fresh from oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow small
town. It is good thing to have Apologetics Study Bible for Students, Black/Tan LeatherTouch because this
book offers to you personally readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you would not get
what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable
arrangement here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to
miss this? Find this book as well as read it from currently!
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