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Designed for those beginning to study linguistics, this is a lively introduction to two key aspects of the
structure of language: syntax (the structure of sentences) and morphology (the structure of words). It shows
students in a step-by-step fashion how to analyze the syntax and morphology of any language, by clearly
describing the basic methods and techniques, and providing almost 100 practical exercises based on data
from a rich variety of the world's languages. Written in an engaging style and complete with a
comprehensive glossary, Exploring Language Structure explains linguistic concepts by using clear analogies
from everyday life. It introduces a range of essential topics in syntax and morphology, such as rules,
categories, word classes, grammatical relations, multi-clause constructions and typology. Providing a solid
foundation in morphology and syntax, this is the perfect introductory text for beginning students, and will
fully prepare them for more advanced courses in linguistic analysis.
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From reader reviews:

Kristen Zamora:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive at this point, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place
and notice simply by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. That's why, by reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand
up than other is high. For you who want to start reading a book, we give you this specific Exploring
Language Structure: A Student's Guide book as beginning and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book
is greater than just a book.

Charles Lee:

As people who live in the modest era should be update about what going on or details even knowledge to
make these people keep up with the era that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will update
themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you is you don't know
what kind you should start with. This Exploring Language Structure: A Student's Guide is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in this
era.

Margaret Honig:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need more time to
be study. Exploring Language Structure: A Student's Guide can be your answer as it can be read by a person
who have those short free time problems.

Gary Jensen:

Book is one of source of understanding. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen require book to know the upgrade information of year for you to year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the
world. By the book Exploring Language Structure: A Student's Guide we can take more advantage. Don't
you to definitely be creative people? To become creative person must like to read a book. Simply choose the
best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this time book
Exploring Language Structure: A Student's Guide. You can more attractive than now.
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