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Every night, before Sylvia goes to sleep, she whispers a magic spell to the rhyme-elves. In the morning her
Wonder Book is filled with beautiful pictures and poems of her adventures and the extraordinary stories she
has heard. There is nothing Sylvia loves more than stories; so every day she asks her mother, the old
woodsman and even her fairy friend Sister-in-the-Bushes to tell them to her. They weave magical stories of
clever princesses, far-away kingdoms, courageous knights, kind children and graceful fairies. During the
day, Sylvia also has her own adventures: planting a fairy tree, meeting St Nicholas and venturing into the
deep woods. But as she comes closer to her special seventh birthday, there is one extraordinary adventure
left. This enchanting collection of tales, charmingly told by Isabel Wyatt, takes us through the highlights of
the year as Sylvia and her friends celebrate festivals and birthdays.
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From reader reviews:

Shirley Demers:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a book you will get new information since book is one of several ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make a person more imaginative. When you
looking at a book especially hype book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the characters do
it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other people. When you read this The Seven-Year-Old
Wonder Book, it is possible to tells your family, friends and also soon about yours publication. Your
knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a book.

Lenora Dryer:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, going to beach, or
picnic from the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book might be option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the reserve untitled The Seven-Year-Old Wonder Book can be excellent
book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

William Burmeister:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with friends is thing that usually
you may have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you have been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love The Seven-Year-Old Wonder Book,
you can enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hangout type is
it? Oh come on its mind hangout men. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Enrique Boggs:

This The Seven-Year-Old Wonder Book is great reserve for you because the content that is full of
information for you who else always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This specific
book reveal it details accurately using great coordinate word or we can state no rambling sentences included.
So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward
sentences but tough core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having The Seven-Year-Old Wonder
Book in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that
no guide that offer you world inside ten or fifteen tiny right but this book already do that. So , this is
certainly good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that?
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