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From Pulitzer Prize–winning architectural critic Paul Goldberger: an engaging, nuanced exploration of the
life and work of Frank Gehry, undoubtedly the most famous architect of our time. This first full-fledged
critical biography presents and evaluates the work of a man who has almost single-handedly transformed
contemporary architecture in his innovative use of materials, design, and form, and who is among the very
few architects in history to be both respected by critics as a creative, cutting-edge force and embraced by the
general public as a popular figure.

Building Art shows the full range of Gehry’s work, from early houses constructed of plywood and chain-link
fencing to lamps made in the shape of fish to the triumphant success of such late projects as the spectacular
art museum of glass in Paris. It tells the story behind Gehry’s own house, which upset his neighbors and
excited the world with its mix of the traditional and the extraordinary, and recounts how Gehry came to
design the Guggenheim Museum in Bilbao, Spain, his remarkable structure of swirling titanium that changed
a declining city into a destination spot. Building Art also explains Gehry’s sixteen-year quest to complete
Walt Disney Concert Hall, the beautiful, acoustically brilliant home of the Los Angeles Philharmonic.

Although Gehry’s architecture has been written about widely, the story of his life has never been told in full
detail. Here we come to know his Jewish immigrant family, his working-class Toronto childhood, his hours
spent playing with blocks on his grandmother’s kitchen floor, his move to Los Angeles when he was still a
teenager, and how he came, unexpectedly, to end up in architecture school. Most important, Building Art
presents and evaluates Gehry’s lifetime of work in conjunction with his entire life story, including his time in
the army and at Harvard, his long relationship with his psychiatrist and the impact it had on his work, and his
two marriages and four children. It analyzes his carefully crafted persona, in which a casual, amiable “aw,
shucks” surface masks a driving and intense ambition. And it explores his relationship to Los Angeles and
how its position as home to outsider artists gave him the freedom in his formative years to make the
innovations that characterize his genius. Finally, it discusses his interest in using technology not just to
change the way a building looks but to change the way the whole profession of architecture is practiced.

At once a sweeping view of a great architect and an intimate look at creative genius, Building Art is in many
ways the saga of the architectural milieu of the twenty-first century. But most of all it is the compelling story
of the man who first comes to mind when we think of the lasting possibilities of buildings as art. 
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From reader reviews:

Tyrell Gutierrez:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a go walking,
shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled Building Art: The Life
and Work of Frank Gehry? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time
along with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have
some other opinion?

Joshua Orvis:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not need people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading through
a book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Building Art: The Life and Work of
Frank Gehry book because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the details in this
book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Olive Wilson:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day simply by watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Building Art: The Life and Work of
Frank Gehry can be the respond to, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date,
spending your extra time by reading in this completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
publications have than the others?

Karen Perl:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the
library or even make summary for some book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's
heart and soul or real their hobby. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They
go to at this time there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important,
boring in addition to can't see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very
important to suit your needs. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise
word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this Building Art: The Life and Work of Frank
Gehry can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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