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Know you’ll pass before you take the exam.

If you are planning to take paying passengers on your boat or you want to save money on your insurance,
you’ll need to pass the U.S. Coast Guard captain’s ratings exams. Get Your Captain’s License is the quickest,
easiest, and least expensive way to prepare for these tests. This complete study tool includes:

The six-passenger “Six-Pack,” Master and Mate Inland, Master and Mate Near Coastal, and Sail/Auxiliary●

Sail Endorsement
400 pages of tutorials on seamanship and navigation●

PEARSoft’s new and improved interactive CD-ROM with all 14,000 questions and answers in the USCG●

database

With its essential advice and unlimited opportunities for exam practice, this book is your sure course to
passing the tests and securing your license.

Please note: CD-ROM is compatible with PC only.
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From reader reviews:

Pamela Rhodes:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be revise about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is certainly always change and advance. Some of
you maybe will certainly update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for yourself but the
problems coming to anyone is you don't know which you should start with. This Get Your Captain's License,
Fourth Edition is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what
you want and wish in this era.

Corinne Schlegel:

Now a day people who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each data they get. How individuals to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information specially this Get Your Captain's License, Fourth
Edition book as this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book
hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

David Gonzales:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their own reader with their
story as well as their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the guides. But also they write about the
data about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons or
daughters, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve
their ability in writing, they also doing some research before they write with their book. One of them is this
Get Your Captain's License, Fourth Edition.

Gerard Armstrong:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen will need book to know the up-date information of year to be able to year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around
the world. By book Get Your Captain's License, Fourth Edition we can consider more advantage. Don't you
to definitely be creative people? To become creative person must love to read a book. Just simply choose the
best book that suitable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this book Get Your
Captain's License, Fourth Edition. You can more appealing than now.
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