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Like his counterpart in the U.S., prominent origami artist and scientist Robert J. Lang, Jun Maekawa
approaches origami from the perspective of mathematical and geometric principles. In Genuine Origami,
Maekawa takes readers, step-by-step, through the fundamentals of his method, beginning with the basics and
guiding them through simple figures (a mouse, an elephant, Santa Claus) all the way up to such highly
sophisticated models as his signature creations, the devil and the peacock.

The 43 different models are grouped into five sections, including one chapter on the ABCs, three which
present projects in order of increasing difficulty (Simple, Intermediate and Complex), and one called
Varieties of Origami, which reveals how to use different kinds of papers and techniques. In addition to the
folding instructions and diagrams, Maekawa explains the mathematical theory behind each project.

An intriguing blend of art and science, Genuine Origami will allow newcomers to discover the pleasures of
folding at the same time that it enables beginners and experts alike to learn clever, surprising and elegant
sequences to produce exceptional results.
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From reader reviews:

Galen Dent:

Typically the book Genuine Origami: 43 Mathematically-Based Models, From Simple to Complex has a lot
info on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was compiled by the very
famous author. Tom makes some research before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you
can obtain the point easily after scanning this book.

Molly Edwards:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Genuine Origami: 43 Mathematically-
Based Models, From Simple to Complex guide written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make
book that may be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written throughout good manner for you,
leaking every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still question
Genuine Origami: 43 Mathematically-Based Models, From Simple to Complex as good book not merely by
the cover but also by content. This is one reserve that can break don't judge book by its include, so do you
still needing one more sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense
already alerted you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Jennifer McNab:

As we know that book is important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we would like. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
has been exactly added. This guide Genuine Origami: 43 Mathematically-Based Models, From Simple to
Complex was filled regarding science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific
disciplines competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know
how big benefit from a book, you can experience enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like at this point,
many ways to get book that you wanted.

Enrique Boggs:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the top book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is
known as of book Genuine Origami: 43 Mathematically-Based Models, From Simple to Complex. You can
contribute your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make a
person happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one
spot to other place.
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