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Here is the newest title in Barron's delightful Ella Bella series! In this story, Ella's kindly ballet teacher,
Madame Rosa, has given the children costumes to wear as her magical music box pours out a shimmering
tune. "This is A Midsummer Night's Dream by Felix Mendelssohn," she says, as she tells the children about
the Shakespearean story that inspired Mendelssohn's ballet. When Madame Rosa is through, she asks all of
her little ballerinas to "dance like fairies!"
When everyone else goes off to change, Ella stays behind for just one more fairy dance…and finds herself
transported into the story of A Midsummer Night's Dream. There, she meets Puck, the mischievous fairy, and
Oberon, King of Fairyland. Oberon asks Puck to help him win back the heart of Titania, his fairy queen.
Puck, in turn, enlists Ella to help him in his midsummer mischief.
This charming story is beautifully illuminated by James Mayhew's whimsical, lovely, and colorful
illustrations. A brief passage at the back of the book tells the story of William Shakespeare's beloved
comedy. It also includes some interesting facts about Felix Mendelssohn and his sparkling, scurrying,
enchanting music.
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From reader reviews:

John Sanchez:

The book Ella Bella Ballerina and A Midsummer Night's Dream (Ella Bella Ballerina Series) give you a
sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable considerably more
increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem together with your
subject. If you can make looking at a book Ella Bella Ballerina and A Midsummer Night's Dream (Ella Bella
Ballerina Series) for being your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your current
capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You can know everything if you like
available and read a publication Ella Bella Ballerina and A Midsummer Night's Dream (Ella Bella Ballerina
Series). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other individuals. So ,
how do you think about this publication?

Allison Price:

This Ella Bella Ballerina and A Midsummer Night's Dream (Ella Bella Ballerina Series) is great book for
you because the content and that is full of information for you who all always deal with world and possess to
make decision every minute. That book reveal it facts accurately using great arrange word or we can state no
rambling sentences in it. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it
only gives you straight forward sentences but challenging core information with attractive delivering
sentences. Having Ella Bella Ballerina and A Midsummer Night's Dream (Ella Bella Ballerina Series) in
your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no publication
that offer you world in ten or fifteen moment right but this publication already do that. So , this can be good
reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt this?

Brittany Belliveau:

The book untitled Ella Bella Ballerina and A Midsummer Night's Dream (Ella Bella Ballerina Series)
contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains your ex idea with easy approach. The language is
very straightforward all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was
compiled by famous author. The author provides you in the new time of literary works. It is possible to read
this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book in anywhere
and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official web-site as well as order it. Have
a nice learn.

Chrissy Stallings:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book had been rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book but additionally novel and Ella Bella Ballerina and A Midsummer Night's
Dream (Ella Bella Ballerina Series) as well as others sources were given understanding for you. After you



know how the fantastic a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher
or maybe students especially. Those books are helping them to increase their knowledge. In additional case,
beside science e-book, any other book likes Ella Bella Ballerina and A Midsummer Night's Dream (Ella
Bella Ballerina Series) to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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