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Philip Graves, one of the world's leading experts in consumer behavior, reveals why the findings obtained
from most market research are completely unreliable. Whether it is company executives seeking to define
their corporate strategy or politicians wanting to understand the electorate, the idea that questions answered
on a questionnaire or discussed in a focus group can provide useful insights on which to base business
decisions is the cause of product failures, political blunders and wasted billions. Consumer.ology exposes
some of the most expensive examples of research-driven thinking clouding judgment, experience and
evidence - from New Coke to General Motors, from Mattel to the Millennium Dome - and instances of
success through ignoring market research, such as Baileys and Doctor Who. It also shows organizations the
tools they should be using if they want to understand their customers. Using his unique AFECT approach, a
set of five criteria to evaluate the reliability of any consumer insight, Graves asserts that it's time for a fresh
approach that embraces this new understanding of human behavior.
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From reader reviews:

Tracy Painter:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yeah, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or even read a book allowed
Consumerology, New Edition: The Truth about Consumers and the Psychology of Shopping? Maybe it is
being best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's
book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have different
opinion?

Jeffrey David:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you read a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, as well as
soon. The Consumerology, New Edition: The Truth about Consumers and the Psychology of Shopping will
give you new experience in examining a book.

Margaret Thompson:

You can find this Consumerology, New Edition: The Truth about Consumers and the Psychology of
Shopping by look at the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve problem if
you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only by means of written or
printed but also can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking
because of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways
to get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose right ways for you.

Ron Taylor:

Some people said that they feel weary when they reading a guide. They are directly felt it when they get a
half areas of the book. You can choose the book Consumerology, New Edition: The Truth about Consumers
and the Psychology of Shopping to make your own reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading
proficiency is developing when you like reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to study it and
mingle the opinion about book and reading through especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to wide
open a book and read it. Beside that the guide Consumerology, New Edition: The Truth about Consumers
and the Psychology of Shopping can to be a newly purchased friend when you're experience alone and
confuse in doing what must you're doing of this time.
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