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The effects of trauma and abuse on children can be long-lasting, acute and damaging. Evidence suggests that
cognitive behavioural therapy (CBT) is a highly effective form of psychotherapy to help children to
overcome these effects. This book uses an evidence-based CBT treatment model to assist children and
adolescents aged 9-15 years to resolve trauma symptoms and increase their coping skills. The approach is
made up of 16 step-by-step sessions to carry out with the young person, and includes worksheets and fun
activities using arts and crafts. The model uses four phases: strengthening the child's psychosocial context;
enhancing their coping skills; processing their trauma through gradual exposure; and addressing special
issues that the child may have and preventing relapse. The child keeps a scrapbook for the duration of the
programme in which they keep worksheets, artwork and any other activities they carry out. The approach is
designed for individual therapy but also includes sessions for parents and caregivers. With photocopiable
worksheets and easy to follow sessions, this will be an invaluable resource for all practitioners working with
traumatised and abused children, including therapists, psychologists, counsellors, health professionals and
social workers
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From reader reviews:

Julio Keith:

Inside other case, little people like to read book Cognitive Behavioural Therapy for Child Trauma and
Abuse: A Step-by-Step Approach. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. So long as
we know about how is important any book Cognitive Behavioural Therapy for Child Trauma and Abuse: A
Step-by-Step Approach. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by the book.
Absolutely right, simply because from book you can learn everything! From your country until foreign or
abroad you may be known. About simple point until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era,
we can open a book as well as searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You can use it when you
feel fed up to go to the library. Let's read.

Shawn Jones:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book mainly book entitled Cognitive
Behavioural Therapy for Child Trauma and Abuse: A Step-by-Step Approach the mind will drift away
trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely might be your
mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a reserve then become one contact form conclusion and
explanation in which maybe you never get just before. The Cognitive Behavioural Therapy for Child Trauma
and Abuse: A Step-by-Step Approach giving you another experience more than blown away your thoughts
but also giving you useful information for your better life on this era. So now let us present to you the
relaxing pattern the following is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished looking
at it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Gilbert Pellerin:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its protect may
doesn't work at this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not as fantastic as
in the outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer could be Cognitive Behavioural Therapy for Child
Trauma and Abuse: A Step-by-Step Approach why because the wonderful cover that make you consider with
regards to the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside as
well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

James Johnson:

The book untitled Cognitive Behavioural Therapy for Child Trauma and Abuse: A Step-by-Step Approach
contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains the woman idea with easy way. The language is
very clear to see all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was written by famous
author. The author gives you in the new era of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can
keep reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a



situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site and order it. Have a nice
examine.
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