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Belle W. Baruch (1899-1964) could outride, outshoot, outhunt, and outsail most of the young men of her
elite social circle--abilities that distanced her from other debutantes of 1917. Unapologetic for her athleticism
and interests in traditionally masculine pursuits, Baruch towered above male and female counterparts in
height and daring. While she is known today for the wildlife conservation and biological research center on
the South Carolina coast that bears her family name, Belle's story is a rich narrative about one
nonconformist's ties to the land. In Baroness of Hobcaw, Mary E. Miller provides a provocative portrait of
this unorthodox woman who gave a gift of monumental importance to the scientific community.
Belle's father, Bernard M. Baruch, the so-called Wolf of Wall Street, held sway over the financial and
diplomatic world of the early twentieth century and served as an adviser to seven U.S. presidents. In 1905 he
bought Hobcaw Barony, a sprawling seaside retreat where he entertained the likes of Churchill and FDR.
Belle's daily life at Hobcaw reflects the world of wealthy northerners, including the Vanderbilts and Luces,
who bought tracts of southern acreage. Miller details Belle's exploits--fox hunting at Hobcaw, show jumping
at Deauville, flying her own plane, traveling with Edith Bolling Wilson, and patrolling the South Carolina
beach for spies during World War II. Belle's story also reveals her efforts to win her mother's approval and
her father's attention, as well as her unraveling relationships with friends, family, employees, and lovers--
both male and female. Miller describes Belle's final success in saving Hobcaw from development as the
overarching triumph of a tempestuous life.
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From reader reviews:

William Herold:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that publication
has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are
really reading whatever they consider because their hobby will be reading a book. What about the person
who don't like studying a book? Sometime, man feel need book if they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Baroness of Hobcaw: The Life of Belle W. Baruch.

Maureen Perdue:

The particular book Baroness of Hobcaw: The Life of Belle W. Baruch has a lot of information on it. So
when you check out this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very famous author.
The author makes some research before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you will get
the point easily after perusing this book.

Vivian Nava:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to select book like comic,
small story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not hoping Baroness of Hobcaw: The Life of
Belle W. Baruch that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading
addiction all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world considerably better then
how they react toward the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky
individual but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for every you who want to start
reading through as your good habit, you can pick Baroness of Hobcaw: The Life of Belle W. Baruch become
your own personal starter.

Allen Green:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but in addition novel and Baroness of Hobcaw: The Life of Belle W. Baruch
or perhaps others sources were given information for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel
desire to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those
books are helping them to bring their knowledge. In other case, beside science e-book, any other book likes
Baroness of Hobcaw: The Life of Belle W. Baruch to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types
of book like this.
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