
"THE GOLDEN JONAHS"
Edgar Starkey

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://youkof.club/go/read.php?id=1418449334
http://youkof.club/go/read.php?id=1418449334
http://youkof.club/go/read.php?id=1418449334


"THE GOLDEN JONAHS"

Edgar Starkey

"THE GOLDEN JONAHS" Edgar Starkey
THE GOLDEN JONAHS, A reality/fiction/music/romance epic that chronicles the American jazz scene
from 1900 New Orleans, to Chicago, then on to New York, featuring the "Big Band Swing Era" of the 30s
and 40s. It details a succession of, tragic, heartrending love affairs throughout the lifetimes of three talented
musicians who each are plagued by a "Jonah" curse. Famed cornet player, DIXIE HARTE, along with friend
and mentor, SHADOW MANION, a prototype of HOAGY CARMICHAEL, enliven the New Orleans jazz
scene in the early 1900s. Dixie's romance with gorgeous Cajun Belle, MARIA LeCAIRE, ends with her
death during childbirth. The ravishing actress, NITA MORGAN, is slain by a jealous husband. In 1930,
Dixie is summoned to New York, in 1930, by renowned bandleader, PAUL WHITEMAN, to replace
alcoholic horn man, BIX BEIDERBECKE. Enroute, Dixie is killed in an automobile wreck. Dixie had often
referred to himself as a "JONAH," one who is cursed and/or bears ill will to others. Dixie's reincarnation,
DANNY O'NEAL, is born a year later. As a promising young trumpet player, in love with the bewitching
beauty, BECKY MARTIN, Danny is sent to Korea in 1950 and, later, reported killed. As a prisoner of war
he contracts the dread beriberi disease. Upon his return home, he discovers that his precious Becky has bore
him a son, DANNY O'NEAL JR., but, also, has remarried. When Danny's death is eminent, he arranges to be
hypnotically retrogressed back to the year 1930, to the bedside of dying Dixie Harte, in an attempt to re-enter
and assume the life of his previous entity. The revived Dixie Harte, has no memory of his previous lives As a
featured trumpet player. Dixie, along with his beautiful wife, talented vocalist, KATHY KAY, and lifelong
friend, SHADOW MANION, co-mingle with famous bandleaders, musicians, and celebrities of the "Big
Band, Swing Era". Dixie's untimely demise, on a disastrous plane flight from London to Paris in 1944, also
claims the life of famous orchestra leader, GLEN
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From reader reviews:

Dorothy Marr:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by simply
surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. Sure, by
reading a reserve your ability to survive improve then having chance to stay than other is high. For you who
want to start reading any book, we give you this kind of "THE GOLDEN JONAHS" book as basic and daily
reading guide. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Teresa Brown:

As people who live in the modest era should be update about what going on or data even knowledge to make
all of them keep up with the era which can be always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you is you don't
know which you should start with. This "THE GOLDEN JONAHS" is our recommendation to make you
keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Richard Dutton:

This "THE GOLDEN JONAHS" tend to be reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why.
The explanation of this "THE GOLDEN JONAHS" can be one of many great books you must have is
definitely giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed an individual with information that
perhaps will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it almost
everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed people. Beside that this "THE
GOLDEN JONAHS" giving you an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you demo
of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Eileen Schmitt:

Guide is one of source of knowledge. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to help year. As we know those publications
have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. By the
book "THE GOLDEN JONAHS" we can consider more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? Being
creative person must love to read a book. Just choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't possibly
be doubt to change your life with that book "THE GOLDEN JONAHS". You can more pleasing than now.
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